29 April 2019
FOI Request Response (ref. 33/1406)

For the following five academic years:

2014-15

2015-16

2016-17

2017-18

2018-19 (to date, if figures are available)

If you only have information for some of the above years please provide what you have and explain
the gaps in your data.

Student-on-staff complaints

1.A Over the past five academic years, how many staff have made formal complaints of racial
harassment by students?

1.B If recorded, please break down how many complaints were made by academic staff and non-
academic staff?

1.C How many of these complaints were upheld?

1.D How many students were suspended or expelled following these complaints?

Academic | No of staff who No of No of No of No of

year have made complaints complaints complaints | students
formal from from non- upheld suspended or
complaints of academic academic expelled
racial staff staff following
harassment by these
students complaints

2014-15 0 N/A N/A N/A N/A

2015-16 0 N/A N/A N/A N/A

2016-17 0 N/A N/A

2017-18 0 N/A N/A N/A N/A

2018-19 0 N/A N/A N/A N/A

(to date)

Student compensation

2. What is the total value of compensation paid to students who suffered racism, including racial
harassment, assault or discrimination, by staff or other students over the past five years?

£0
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Staff compensation

3. What is the total value of compensation paid to staff who suffered racism, including racial
harassment, assault or discrimination, by other staff or students over the past five years?

£0
Islamophobia

4.A Does the university centrally record complaints of Islamophobia by staff and students?
Yes

4.B If so, are these complaints recorded as racism, i.e. were they included in your response to my
previous FOI about complaints about racism?
Yes

4.C If not, how are these complaints classified?
N/A

4.D When did the university start recording complaints of Islamophobia?

Information not held.

Antisemitism

5.A Does the university centrally record complaints of antisemitism by staff and students?
Yes

5.B If so, are these complaints recorded as racism, i.e. were they included in your response to my
previous FOI about complaints about racism?
Yes

5.C If not, how are these complaints classified?
N/A

5.D When did the university start recording complaints of antisemitism?

Information not held.
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